ESM Solutions - Sourcing - Line Item Bid

Event ID B2005

Event Name Printing Spring, Summer, & Fall Registration Guides

Section Name Standard Line Item Pricing

Section Attachments

| Vendor | Total Cost | Guides Included | |
|-------------------------------|--------------|------------------------|--|
| Publication Printers | \$32,875.01 | Spring only | |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | \$99,645.00 | Fall, Spring, & Summer | |
| Fidelity Print Communications | \$120,036.75 | Fall, Spring, & Summer | |
| Meridian | \$137,244.45 | Fall, Spring, & Summer | |
| Hilton Publishing | \$138,339.93 | Fall, Spring, & Summer | |
| Cenveo Corporation | \$141,080.01 | Fall, Spring, & Summer | |
| RPM Design + Production | \$159,673.14 | Fall, Spring, & Summer | |

| Supplier Name | Response Notes | | Item NItem/Service (Required - Entity) | Quant Unit Bid Price (Re | | SupplierNotes | Attachmer NoBid |
|-------------------------------|----------------|---|--|--------------------------|-------------|---|-----------------|
| enveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 1. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printin | ng 1 \$37,013.46 | \$37,013.46 | see attached quote for further detailed specs | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | , | et 1 \$1,750.00 | \$1,750.00 | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | Post Office 3. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | er 5 \$335.00 | \$1,675.00 | per drop | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternations: Total cost for Business Reply Card printer | | \$6,588.21 | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | and inserted into registration guides5. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed | d. 1 | | | Yes |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) 6. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed | | | | Vos |
| | | | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) | t 'no | | | Yes |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | | | | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | Post Office | | \$1,750.00 | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | | \$1,675.00 | per drop | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printo and inserted into registration guides | | \$6,588.21 | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 11. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not list Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) | | | | Yes |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 12. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not list Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) | | | | Yes |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 13. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 \$37,013.46 | \$37,013.46 | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 14. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet P Office | Post 1 \$1,750.00 | \$1,750.00 | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other F Offices (specify charge per drop) | Post 5 \$335.00 | \$1,675.00 | per drop | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 16. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printer and inserted into registration guides | | \$6,588.21 | | No |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 17. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) | t 'no | | | Yes |
| Cenveo Corporation | | Quote Details, Certification of Bidder, Receipt of Addendum | 18. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) | t 'no | | | Yes |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 1. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printin | | \$34,632.67 | 70lb Orion Satin Text FSC 10% PCW | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Jolie Post Office | | \$115.00 | | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | | \$125.00 | | No |
| idelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternations: Total cost for Business Reply Card printer and inserted into registration guides | | \$5,139.58 | 7pt Norpac Hibulk Reply Card | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 5. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) | | | | Yes |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 6. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed Please provide cost description. (If none, please select bid' on this line.) | | | | Yes |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 7. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Print | ting 1 \$34,632.67 | \$34,632.67 | 70lb Orion Satin Text FSC 10% PCW | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 8. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Jo Post Office | liet 1 \$115.00 | \$115.00 | | No |

| Supplier Name | Response Notes | Response Attachment | Item | | ant Uni | | tended Bid Pric Notes | SupplierNotes | Attachmer NoBid |
|-------------------------------|--|---|------|--|---------|-------------|-----------------------|-----------------------------------|-----------------|
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 9. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$25.00 | \$125.00 | | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 10. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$5,139.58 | \$5,139.58 | 7pt Norpac Hibulk Reply Card | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 11. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 12. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 13. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$34,632.67 | \$34,632.67 | 70lb Orion Satin Text FSC 10% PCW | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 14. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$115.00 | \$115.00 | | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 15. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$25.00 | \$125.00 | | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 16. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$5,139.58 | \$5,139.58 | 7pt Norpac Hibulk Reply Card | No |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 17. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Fidelity Print Communications | | Addendum, BEP Goal, Signed Certification | 18. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 1. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$33,051.88 | \$33,051.88 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 2. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 3. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other | 5 | \$925.00 | \$4,625.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 4. | Post Offices (specify charge per drop) Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$4,203.43 | \$4,203.43 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 5. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$108.00 | \$108.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 6. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$4,125.00 | \$4,125.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 7. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$33,051.88 | \$33,051.88 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 8. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 9. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other | 5 | \$925.00 | \$4,625.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 10. | Post Offices (specify charge per drop) Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$4,203.43 | \$4,203.43 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 11. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$108.00 | \$108.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 12. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$4,125.00 | \$4,125.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 13. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$33,051.88 | \$33,051.88 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 14. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 15. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$925.00 | \$4,625.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 16. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$4,203.43 | \$4,203.43 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 17. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$108.00 | \$108.00 | | No |
| Hilton Publishing | | Certificate of Contract, Addendum #1 | 18. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$4,125.00 | \$4,125.00 | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | 1. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$31,168.45 | \$31,168.45 | 250,000 = \$31,168.45 | No |

| Supplier Name | Response Notes | | n NItem/Service (Required - Entity) | Quant l | Unit Bid Price (Re | | | Attachme | r NoBid |
|---------------|---|---|--|---------|--------------------|-------------|-----------------------------|----------|---------|
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 2. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | USPS Verification "on-Site" | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$385.48 | \$1,927.40 | \$1,927.44 See Attachment | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 4. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$12,652.30 | \$12,652.30 | 250,000 = \$12,652.30 | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 5. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | | Yes |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 6. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | | Yes |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 7. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$31,168.45 | \$31,168.45 | 250,000 = \$31,168.45 | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 8. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | USPS Verification "on-Site" | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 9. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$385.48 | \$1,927.40 | \$1,927.44 See Attachment | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$12,652.30 | \$12,652.30 | 250,000 = \$12,652.30 | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | | Yes |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | | Yes |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$31,168.45 | \$31,168.45 | 250,000 = \$31,168.45 | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | USPS Verification "on-Site" | | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 15. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$385.48 | \$1,927.40 | \$1,927.44 See Attachment | | No |

| Supplier Name | Response Notes | Response Attachment Item | N Item/Service (Required - Entity) | Quant l | | xtended Bid Pric Notes | SupplierNotes | Attachmer NoBid |
|----------------------|--|---|--|---------|-------------|------------------------|---|-----------------|
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 16. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$12,652.30 | \$12,652.30 | 250,000 = \$12,652.30 | No |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 17. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Meridian | USPS Verification "on-Site" Due to current market fluctuations - Paper pricing and freight are subject to change with current market pricing, rates listed are based on rates of 5/5/21 | Postage and Freight Estimates, B20052 Printing Registration 18. Guides 2022, B20052 Printing Reg Guides AD1 | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$25,392.00 | \$25,392.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$950.00 | \$950.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | | | | Yes |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$2,850.00 | \$2,850.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$4,023.00 | \$4,023.00 | Data Processing/Lettershop/mailing | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$25,392.00 | \$25,392.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$950.00 | \$950.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | | | | Yes |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$2,850.00 | \$2,850.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$4,023.00 | \$4,023.00 | Data Processinf/lettrershop/Mailing | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$25,392.00 | \$25,392.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$950.00 | \$950.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | | | | Yes |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$2,850.00 | \$2,850.00 | | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$4,023.00 | \$4,023.00 | data processing/lettershop mailing | No |
| MOTR GRAFX, LLC | | pricing of spring guide, summer guide pricing, fall guide, addendum No 1, certification contractor bid form | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | | | | Yes |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with Publication Printers. Thank you for the opportunity to bid on this project. | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder 1. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$26,006.15 | \$26,006.15 | 250,000 copies | No |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with Publication Printers. Thank you for the opportunity to bid on this project. | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder 2. | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$593.31 | \$593.31 | DDU in Joliet, IL 60436 - 62,662 pieces | No |

| Supplier Name | Response Notes | Response Attachment | | Quant Unit Bid Price (Re | | | ttachmer NoBid |
|-----------------------------------|---|--|---|--------------------------|-------------|--|----------------|
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 3. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other | 5 \$299.85 | \$1,499.25 | DDU in Plainfield, IL 60544 - 32,359 pieces 411.10 - SCF | No |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the opportunity to bid on this project. | | Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | | | in Forest Park, IL 60130 - 1088.15 | |
| ublication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 4. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative | 1 \$4,776.30 | \$4,776.30 | 250,000 copies | No |
| -ublication Filliters | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bluder | specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed | 34,770.30 | 54,770.30 | 250,000 copies | NO |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | and inserted into registration guides | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 5. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | Quote zetter a remis, certification of contract, place | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | bid' on this line.) | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 6. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | bid' on this line.) | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 7. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 8. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Post Office | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 9. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other | 5 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 10. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | and inserted into registration guides | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 11. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | bid' on this line.) | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 12. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | bid' on this line.) | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 13. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 14. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Office | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 15. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post | 5 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Offices (specify charge per drop) | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 16. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | and inserted into registration guides | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 17. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | bid' on this line.) | | | | |
| Publication Printers | My name is Shane Manning with | Quote Letter & Terms, Certification of Contract/Bidder | 18. Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 | | | Yes |
| | Publication Printers. Thank you for the | | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | | | |
| | opportunity to bid on this project. | | bid' on this line.) | | | | |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 \$38,147.37 | \$38,147.37 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet | 1 \$85.00 | \$85.00 | | No |
| | | | Post Office | | | | NO |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 3. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 \$380.00 | \$1,900.00 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 4. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative | 1 \$9,544.89 | \$9,544.89 | | No |
| | | | specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed | | | | |
| | | | and inserted into registration guides | | | | |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 5. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 \$3,391.05 | \$3,391.05 | Mailing services, list processing | No |
| | | | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | | | |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | bid' on this line.)6. Spring 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. | 1 \$156.07 | \$156.07 | Add'l m's | No |
| W Design + Houdelion | | W_52003 Filling Registration Guides 2022 | Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no | | 7130.07 | rad i iii 3 | 140 |
| | | | bid' on this line.) | | | | |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 7. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 \$38,147.37 | \$38,147.37 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 8. Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet | 1 \$85.00 | \$85.00 | | No |
| · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · | • | | 5 | , , , , , , , , | | | 1 |

| Supplier Name | Response Notes | Response Attachment | ltem | N Item/Service (Required - Entity) | Quant l | Jnit Bid Price (Re Ext | ended Bid Pric Notes | SupplierNotes | Attachmer NoBid |
|-------------------------|----------------|---|------|--|---------|------------------------|----------------------|-----------------------------------|-----------------|
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 9. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$380.00 | \$1,900.00 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 10. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$9,544.89 | \$9,544.89 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 11. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$3,391.05 | \$3,391.05 | Mailing services, list processing | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 12. | Summer 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$156.07 | \$156.07 | Add'l M's | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 13. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Total Cost for Printing | 1 | \$38,147.37 | \$38,147.37 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 14. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Joliet Post Office | 1 | \$85.00 | \$85.00 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 15. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Delivery Cost to Other Post Offices (specify charge per drop) | 5 | \$380.00 | \$1,900.00 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 16. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Options for alternative specifications: Total cost for Business Reply Card printed and inserted into registration guides | 1 | \$9,544.89 | \$9,544.89 | | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 17. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$3,391.05 | \$3,391.05 | Mailing services, list processing | No |
| RPM Design + Production | | RPM_B2005 Printing Registration Guides 2022 | 18. | Fall 2022 Registration Guides - Other Cost Not listed. Please provide cost description. (If none, please select 'no bid' on this line.) | 1 | \$156.07 | \$156.07 | Add'l M's | No |